MECHANICAL SERVICES BID TABULATION
NORTHWEST DISTRICT - WEST REGION

Case Electric D&M Plumbing Waldinger
Prevailing] Maint. |Prevailing| Maint. |Prevailing] Maint.
Wage % Rate Wage % Wage % Rate

ANDREW
COUNTY 150% $70
ATCHISON
COUNTY 150% $70
BUCHANAN
COUNTY 150% $70
CLINTON
COUNTY 150% $70

190% $98

218% $112

188%| $96.50

209% $107

DEKALB COUNTY

150% $70 210% $107

GENTRY COUNTY
150% $70

213% $109

HOLT COUNTY

150% $70 227% $116

NODAWAY

COUNTY 150% $70 212%| $108.50

WORTH COUNTY

150% 246% $126

% Mark-up for
Parts/Supplies
Performance

Bond Mark-up

100.7%

Yellow is first vendor.

_:md vendor (contingent).



MECHANICAL SERVICES BID TABULATION
NORTHWEST DISTRICT - EAST REGION

Case Electric D&M Plumbing Waldinger
Prevailing] Maint. |Prevailing| Maint. |Prevailing] Maint.
Wage % Rate Wage % Wage % Rate

HARRISON

150% $75 256% $131

MERCER

150% S75 No Bid

PUTNAM

150% $75 No Bid

SULLIVAN

150% S75 No Bid

% Mark-up for

Parts/Supplies
Performance

Bond Mark-up

Yellow is first vendor.

-md vendor (contingent).




MECHANICAL SERVICES BID TABULATION
NORTHEAST DISTRICT - NORTH REGION

Smith Heating &
D&M Plumbing Cooling

Prevailing] Maint. |Prevailing| Maint.

Wage % Rate Wage % Rate

ADAIR
COUNTY 150%| $85.50 No Bid
CLARK
COUNTY 150%| $85.50 No Bid
[(\[0)¢
COUNTY 150%| $85.50 No Bid
LEWIS
COUNTY 150%| $85.50 No Bid
MACON
COUNTY 150%| $85.50 190% $120
MARION
COUNTY 150%| $85.50 No Bid
SCHUYLER
COUNTY 150%| $85.50 No Bid
SCOTLAND
COUNTY 150%| $85.50 No Bid
SHELBY
COUNTY 150%
% Mark-up for

Parts/Supplies
Performance

Bond Mark-up

$85.50

Yellow is first vendor.



MECHANICAL SERVICES BID TABULATION
NORTHEAST DISTRICT - SOUTH REGION

AUDRAIN
COUNTY

MONROE
COUNTY

PIKE COUNTY

RALLS COUNTY

RANDOLPH
COUNTY

% Mark-up for
Parts/Supplies

Performance
Bond Mark-up

Smith Heating &
D&M Plumbing Cooling

Prevailing| Maint. ]Prevailing| Maint.
Wage % Rate Wage % Rate

150%| $85.50 190% $120

150%| $85.50 190% $120

150%| $85.50 No Bid

150%| $85.50 190% $120

150%| $85.50 190%

Yellow is first vendor.




MECHANICAL SERVICES BID TABULATION
CENTRAL DISTRICT - SOUTH REGION

D&M Plumbing
Prevailing| Maint.
Wage % Rate

CRAWFORD COUNTY

150%| $85.50

DENT COUNTY
150%| $85.50

WASHINGTON COUNTY

150%| $85.50

% Mark-up for

Parts/Supplies
Performance Bond

Mark-up

Yellow is first vendor.



MECHANICAL SERVICES BID TABULATION
SOUTHEAST DISTRICT - NORTH REGION

NO BIDS
Prevailing| Maint.
Wage % Rate

BOLLINGER
COUNTY

CAPE GIRARDEAU
COUNTY

IRON COUNTY

MADISON
COUNTY

PERRY COUNTY

REYNOLDS
COUNTY

ST. FRANCIOUS
COUNTY

STE. GENEVIEVE
COUNTY

% Mark-up for

Parts/Supplies
Performance

Bond Mark-up




MECHANICAL SERVICES BID TABULATION
SOUTHEAST DISTRICT - SOUTH REGION

NO BIDS
Prevailing| Maint.
Wage % Rate

BUTLER COUNTY

CARTER COUNTY

DUNKLIN COUNTY

MISSISSIPPI COUNTY

NEW MADRID COUNTY

PEMISCOT COUNTY

RIPLEY COUNTY

SCOTT COUNTY

STODDARD COUNTY

WAYNE COUNTY

% Mark-up for

Parts/Supplies
Performance Bond

Mark-up




MECHANICAL SERVICES BID TABULATION
SOUTHEAST DISTRICT - WEST REGION

NO BIDS
Prevailing| Maint.
Wage % Rate

DOUGLAS COUNTY

HOWELL COUNTY

OZARK COUNTY

WRIGHT COUNTY

% Mark-up for

Parts/Supplies
Performance

Bond Mark-up
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