Missouri Department of Transportation - District 3

1711A Highway 61 South, PO Box 1067

Tanya Dauma - Procurement

Phone: 573-248-2486

Hannibal, MO 63401 Fax: 573-522-6463
Q03-11-0030 Plastic Sheeting (Poly Film) Tabulation
Burlington Building
Qty Unit Description All American Poly Materials Hertz Equipment Rental Carter Waters LLC Xtra Industries
Clear Plastic Sheeting - 100’ rolls
50 rolls |50' wide, 8 mil thickness 731.50 36,575.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
50 rolls [50' wide, 10 mil thickness 731.50 36,575.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
100 rolls |25' wide, 8 mil thickness 365.90 36,590.00 no bid no bid no bid 121.50 12,150.00
100 rolls [25' wide, 10 mil thickness 365.90 36,590.00 no bid no bid no bid 163.80 16,380.00
125 |rolls|20' wide, 8 mil thickness 293.00 36,625.00 88.77 11,096.25 78.54 9,817.50 75.50 9,437.50 83.65 10,456.25
125 |rolls|20' wide, 10 mil thickness 293.00 36,625.00 110.96 13,870.00 98.18 12,272.50 92.39 11,548.75 97.65 12,206.25

Award Date/Time: June 3, 2011 at 10:40 am
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