Missouri Department of Transportation - District 3
1711A Highway 61 South, PO Box 1067
Hannibal, MO 63401

B03-10-0044 Trap Rock Tabulation

Tanya Dauma - Procurement

Phone: 573-248-2486
Fax: 573-522-6463

Fred Weber - Iron Bobby Hoelscher Joerling Bros. Chester Bross Ren Potterfield
Qty Unit Description Mountain Trap Rock Trucking Inc. Trucking Inc. Construction Co. Trucking Inc. Lomax Trucking
Item #1
| 13,375 ton Trap Rock barged to Louisiana, MO $46.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Iltem #2
1,750 ton Trap Rock delivered to Hannibal no bid $35.55 $33.90 $44.30 no bid $33.94
825 ton Trap Rock delivered to Monroe City no bid $37.55 $35.75 $45.56 $35.80 no bid
1,050 ton Trap Rock delivered to Palmyra no bid $37.00 $35.75 $45.56 no bid $34.90
1,000 ton Trap Rock delivered to LaBelle no bid $41.15 $38.95 $48.85 no bid $39.93
2,000 ton Trap Rock delivered to Novelty no bid $43.40 $41.25 $51.37 no bid no bid
2,225 ton Trap Rock delivered to Memphis no bid $47.30 $44.35 $53.90 $51.50 no bid
1,150 ton Trap Rock delivered to Luray no bid $45.75 $42.75 $52.78 $50.00 no bid
1,575 ton Trap Rock delivered to Wayland no bid $43.50 $40.95 $49.60 $43.80 no bid
1,100 ton Trap Rock delivered to Warrenton no bid $29.50 $27.75 no bid $26.50 no bid
700 ton Trap Rock delivered to Montgomery City no bid $32.50 $30.50 no bid $29.00 no bid
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