
 
 

Temporary Services Bid Tabulation  
B4-09-023 

Fixed Hourly Price for January 1, 2010 to December 31, 2010 
 
 

 Davlin Services 
of Kansas City, Inc. 

Penmac Staffing 
Services, Inc. 

Sun Plus Data 
Group, Inc. 

 
Jackson County  

001 Laborer $9.49 $11.00 No Bid 
002 Maintenance Worker $10.49 $12.75 No Bid 
003 Custodial Worker No Bid $11.50 No Bid 
004 Clerk No Bid $10.75 $20.00 
005 Senior Clerk No Bid $11.25 $25.00 
006 Technician No Bid $11.90 $48.00 

 
Platte County 

 

007 Laborer $9.49 $11.00 No Bid 
008 Maintenance Worker $10.49 $12.75 No Bid 
009 Custodial Worker No Bid $11.50 No Bid 
010 Clerk No Bid $10.75 $18.00 
011 Senior Clerk No Bid $11.25 $23.00 
012 Technician No Bid $11.90 $45.00 

 
Clay County 

013 Laborer $9.49 $11.00 No Bid 
014 Maintenance Worker $10.49 $12.75 No Bid 
015 Custodial Worker No Bid $11.50 No Bid 
016 Clerk No Bid $10.75 $18.00 
017 Senior Clerk No Bid $11.25 $23.00 
018 Technician No Bid $11.90 $45.00 

 
Cass County 

019 Laborer $9.49 $11.00 No Bid 
020 Maintenance Worker $10.49 $12.75 No Bid 
021 Custodial Worker No Bid $11.50 No Bid 
022 Clerk No Bid $10.75 $18.00 
023 Senior Clerk No Bid $11.25 $23.00 
024 Technician No Bid $11.90 $45.00 

 
 Hiring Fee $100.00  $1500.00 

 
* Low Bid Award 
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