
CASS CLAY HENRY JACKSON JOHNSON LAFAYETTE PLATTE RAY
Penny's Concrete, Inc.         

Green Ready Mix                           

913-441-8781
$96.40 $97.90 NO BID $96.40 $96.40 $96.40 $99.90 $97.90

Bid # Q4-10-004 CASS CLAY HENRY JACKSON JOHNSON LAFAYETTE PLATTE RAY

Geiger Ready Mix co., Inc.                          

913-281-0666
$106.75 $106.75 NO BID $106.75 NO BID NO BID $106.75 NO BID

CASS CLAY HENRY JACKSON JOHNSON LAFAYETTE PLATTE RAY

Fischer Concrete Service                          

660-826-3122
NO BID NO BID $110.00 NO BID $111.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

CASS CLAY HENRY JACKSON JOHNSON LAFAYETTE PLATTE RAY

Lafarge North America          

816-257-4071
$135.00 $135.00 NO BID $135.00 NO BID $135.00 $135.00 NO BID

Night Delivery Charges:  Charges begin no later than 5:00 PM and ends when last truck returns to the plant.  Plant & Labor $250.00/hour (4 hour minimum)  Truck & Driver $75.00/hour (4 hour minimum) 

Deliveries to Platte County are limited to Platte City and South

Night Delivery Charges:  6:00 PM to 6:00 AM Monday  - Friday  $180.00/hour for plant and $45.00/hour for each truck.  Weekends:  Noon Saturday - 6:00 AM Monday $220.00/hour for plant and $55.00/hour 

for each truck

1% Calcium - $2.00 - 2% Calcium - $4.00 - Hot Water - $4.50             

Short Load Charge $90.00

ADDITIONAL COMMENTS

ADDITIONAL COMMENTS

1% Calcium - $2.00 - 2% Calcium - $4.00 - Hot Water - $3.00 

Night Delivery Charges:  $20.00/hour/truck after 4:00 PM

ADDITIONAL COMMENTS

1% Calcium - $2.00 - 2% Calcium - $4.00 - Hot Water - $4.50                 

Short Load Charge Varies Based on CUYDS

Pricing below is per cubic yard

MoDOT - District 4

Concrete Ready Mix Pricing

Q4-10-004

April 1, 2010 thru April 1, 2011

Night Delivery Charges:  6:00 PM to 6:00 AM Monday  - Friday  $150.00/hour beginning 30 minutes prior to the scheduled "on the job time" and ending when the last truck returns to the yard.  Add an 

additional $5.00 per cubic yard to the quoted bid price of the concrete for night delivery.

ADDITIONAL COMMENTS

1% Calcium - $3.55 - 2% Calcium - $7.10 - Hot Water - $4.50                 

Short Load Charge $50.00

Deliveries to Cass County are limited to the City of Harrisonville and Northwest

Deliveries to Johnson County are limited to North of Hwy 50 (NW of Warrensburg)


