
Carter Waters No Bid $77.00 $87.00

Keller Construction $60.00 $77.00 No Bid

Vance Brothers $54.00 $79.00 $89.00

Ideker, Inc. No Bid No Bid $123.50

C. B. Asphalt, Inc. $47.00 No Bid No Bid

Leavenworth Asphalt Materials $44.00 No Bid No Bid

Leavenworth Asphalt Materials $46.00 No Bid No Bid

APAC Inc. $39.49 No Bid No Bid

APAC Inc. $39.06 No Bid No Bid

APAC Inc. $46.07 No Bid No Bid

APAC Inc. $51.52 No Bid No Bid

APAC Inc. $46.64 No Bid No Bid

APAC Inc. $55.40 No Bid No Bid
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