
Ed Hassinger, District Engineer 

Missouri  

Department  

of Transportation  

 

     QUOTATION 
 

     TABULATION 
      

     General Services   

  

St. Louis Metro District 

2309 Barrett Station Road 
Ballwin, Mo. 63021 

(314) 301-1439 

Fax (314) 301-1437  
or (573) 526-0016 

www.modot.mo.gov 

Toll Free 1-888 ASK MoDOT 

 

         Thank you for your response to our Request for Quotation D611-063-R7, Equipment Rental-Sunset Hills. 

         For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses which were received. 

         If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown above.     

         Buyer: Stephanie Austin Rashid, General Services Technician  

 

OPTION 1-Delivery to Sunset Hills Maintenance Building 

 
 

QTY 
 

U/M 
 

DESCRIPTION 
(including size and/or part #’s) 

 
Crown Equipment Co. 

 
United Rentals, Inc. 

 
Roland Machinery Co. 

 
Weekly 

 
Monthly 

 
Weekly  

 
Monthly 

 
Weekly 

 
Monthly 

1 Ea Excavator-120D John Deere, SAE operating weight of 

28,840 or above, with arm reach from ground level at 27’ 

10”, max dig depth 19.6’, steel tracks, 36” tooth bucket with 

hydro thumb, closed cab. 

 

 
$1,450.00 

 
 

$4,350.00 

 
 

$1,947.00 

 
 

$4,324.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

1 Ea Excavator-85D John Deere, SAE operating weight of 18,821 

or above, with arm reach from ground level at 23’ 2”, max 

dig depth 13’, steel tracks, 36” tooth bucket, closed cab. 

 
 

$1,000.00 

 
 

$3,000.00 

 
 

$1,015.00 

 
 

$2,850.00 

 
 

$1,480.00 

 
 

$3,170.00 

1 Ea Compact Track Loader, 333D John Deere, Operating weight 

standard 11,100,  95 horsepower, tipping load 9,425, with 

84” tooth bucket, rubber or steel tracks, prefer foot controls, 

enclosed cab. 

 
 

$900.00 

 
 

$2,700.00 

 
 

$1,056.00 

 
 

$2,395.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

Total Rental Cost, Option 1-Delivery: *$3,650.00 *$10,350.00 *$4,418.00 *$9,969.00 $1,480.00 $2,640.00 
 

 

    *Delivery cost round trip is $300 for Crown Equipment 

    *Delivery cost is $100.00 per load for United Rentals, Inc., which is 2 loads per trip, totaling $400.00 

 

 



2 

 

OPTION 1 Continued 
 

QTY 
 

U/M 
 

DESCRIPTION 
(including size and/or part #’s) 

 
Bobcat of St. Louis 

 
Fabick Cat 

 
Weekly 

 
Monthly 

 
Weekly  

 
Monthly 

1 Ea Excavator-120D John Deere, SAE operating weight of 

28,840 or above, with arm reach from ground level at 27’ 

10”, max dig depth 19.6’, steel tracks, 36” tooth bucket with 

hydro thumb, closed cab. 

 
 

$2,110.00 

 
 

$6,110.00 

 
 

$1,800.00 

 
 

$5,400.00 

1 Ea Excavator-85D John Deere, SAE operating weight of 18,821 

or above, with arm reach from ground level at 23’ 2”, max 

dig depth 13’, steel tracks, 36” tooth bucket, closed cab. 

 
 

$1,010.00 

 
 

$2,810.00 

 
 

$1,181.00 

 
 

$3,307.00 

1 Ea Compact Track Loader, 333D John Deere, Operating weight 

standard 11,100,  95 horsepower, tipping load 9,425, with 

84” tooth bucket, rubber or steel tracks, prefer foot controls, 

enclosed cab. 

 
 

$1,010.00 

 
 

$2,810.00 

 
 

$933.00 

 
 

$2,600.00 

Total Rental Cost, Option 1-Delivery: *$4,330.00 *$11,730.00 *$4,514.00 *$11,907 
 

 

    *Delivery cost is $110.00 for each unit for Bobcat of St. Louis, totaling $330.00    

    *Delivery cost $600 round trip for Fabick Cat 
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OPTION 2-Pickup from vendor location 

 
 

QTY 
 

U/M 
 

DESCRIPTION 
(including size and/or part #’s) 

 
Crown Equipment Co. 

 
United Rentals, Inc. 

 
Roland Machinery Co. 

 
Weekly 

 
Monthly 

 
Weekly  

 
Monthly 

 
Weekly 

 
Monthly 

1 Ea Excavator-120D John Deere, SAE operating weight of 

28,840 or above, with arm reach from ground level at 27’ 

10”, max dig depth 19.6’, steel tracks, 36” tooth bucket with 

hydro thumb, closed cab. 

 

 
$1,450.00 

 
 

$4,350.00 

 
 

$1,947.00 

 
 

$4,324.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

1 Ea Excavator-85D John Deere, SAE operating weight of 18,821 

or above, with arm reach from ground level at 23’ 2”, max 

dig depth 13’, steel tracks, 36” tooth bucket, closed cab. 

 
 

$1,000.00 

 
 

$3,000.00 

 
 

$1,015.00 

 
 

$2,850.00 

 
 

$950.00 

 
 

$2,640.00 

1 Ea Compact Track Loader, 333D John Deere, Operating weight 

standard 11,100,  95 horsepower, tipping load 9,425, with 

84” tooth bucket, rubber or steel tracks, prefer foot controls, 

enclosed cab. 

 
 

$900.00 

 
 

$2700.00 

 
 

$1,056.00 

 
 

$2,395.00 

 
 

No Bid 

 
 

No Bid 

Total Rental Cost, Option 2-Pickup: $3,350.00 $10,050.00 $4,018.00 $9,569.00 $950.00 $2,640.00 
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OPTION 2 Continued 

 

 
 

QTY 
 

U/M 
 

DESCRIPTION 
(including size and/or part #’s) 

 
Bobcat of St. Louis 

 
Fabick Cat 

 
Weekly 

 
Monthly 

 
Weekly 

 
Monthly 

1 Ea Excavator-120D John Deere, SAE operating weight of 

28,840 or above, with arm reach from ground level at 27’ 

10”, max dig depth 19.6’, steel tracks, 36” tooth bucket with 

hydro thumb, closed cab. 

 
 

$2,000.00 

 
 

$6,000.00 

 
 

$1,800.00 

 
 

$5,400.00 

1 Ea Excavator-85D John Deere, SAE operating weight of 18,821 

or above, with arm reach from ground level at 23’ 2”, max 

dig depth 13’, steel tracks, 36” tooth bucket, closed cab. 

 
 

$900.00 

 
 

$2,700.00 

 
 

$1,181.00 

 
 

$3,307.00 

1 Ea Compact Track Loader, 333D John Deere, Operating weight 

standard 11,100,  95 horsepower, tipping load 9,425, with 

84” tooth bucket, rubber or steel tracks, prefer foot controls, 

enclosed cab. 

 
 

$900.00 

 
 

$2,700.00 

 
 

$933.00 

 
 

$2,600.00 

Total Rental Cost, Option 2-Pickup: $4,000.00 $11,400.00 $3,914.00 $11,307.00  

 


