



**MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
DISTRICT 5
D5-09-035B BID TABULATION - ASPHALT PLANT PICKUP / PRICE PER TON**

PRICES ARE GOOD FROM APRIL 15, 2009 THROUGH MAY 31, 2009.
BID PRICES WILL BE UPDATED MONTHLY

ITEM #1 - BASE HOT MIX FOLLOWING SPECIFICATION SECTION 401 MO STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS FOR HIGHWAY CONSTRUCTION

COUNTIES	VENDORS										
	Higgins Asphalt	N.B. West	APAC	Lake Asphalt	Hilty Quarries	Asphalt Products	Pace Const.	Christensen Brothers	Rolla Asphalt	Willard Asphalt	Lafarge
BENTON											
BOONE			\$48.00								
CAMDEN			\$48.00	\$50.00							
CALLAWAY			\$51.00					\$49.00			
COLE						\$45.00					
COOPER											
CRAWFORD		\$45.00							\$50.00		
FRANKLIN											
GASCONADE											
LACLEDE										\$52.00	
MARIES											
MILLER			\$48.00	\$50.00							
MONITEAU											
MONTGOMERY							\$50.00				
MORGAN											
OSAGE	\$49.10										
PETTIS											\$49.00
PHELPS									\$50.00		
PULASKI										\$52.00	
SALINE			\$53.00								
JOHNSON					\$57.00						
HENRY					\$57.00						

*** MoDOT RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CHOOSE A SUPPLIER BASED UPON AVAILABILITY AND COST IN RESPECT TO PLANT LOCATIONS IN ANY GIVEN AREA PER PROJECT.



MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
DISTRICT 5
D5-09-035B BID TABULATION - ASPHALT PLANT PICKUP / PRICE PER TON
 PRICES ARE GOOD FROM APRIL 15, 2009 THROUGH MAY 31, 2009.

ITEM #2 - BP-1 HOT MIX FOLLOWING SPECIFICATION SECTION 401 MO STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS FOR HIGHWAY CONSTRUCTION

COUNTIES	VENDORS										
	Higgins Asphalt	N.B. West	APAC	Lake Asphalt	Hilty Quarries	Asphalt Products	Pace Const.	Christensen Brothers	Rolla Asphalt	Willard Asphalt	Lafarge
BENTON											
BOONE			\$51.00								
CAMDEN			\$51.00	\$50.00							
CALLAWAY			\$54.00					\$51.00			
COLE						\$47.00					
COOPER											
CRAWFORD		\$45.00							\$50.00		
FRANKLIN											
GASCONADE											
LACLEDE										\$52.00	
MARIES											
MILLER			\$51.00	\$50.00							
MONITEAU											
MONTGOMERY							\$50.00				
MORGAN											
OSAGE	\$51.10										
PETTIS											
PHELPS									\$50.00		
PULASKI										\$52.00	
SALINE			\$56.00								
JOHNSON					\$59.00						
HENRY					\$59.00						

NO BID

*** MoDOT RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CHOOSE A SUPPLIER BASED UPON AVAILABILITY AND COST IN RESPECT TO PLANT LOCATIONS IN ANY GIVEN AREA PER PROJECT.



MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
DISTRICT 5
D5-09-035B BID TABULATION - ASPHALT PLANT PICKUP / PRICE PER TON
 PRICES ARE GOOD FROM APRIL 15, 2009 THROUGH MAY 31, 2009.

ITEM #3 - BP-2 HOT MIX FOLLOWING SPECIFICATION SECTION 401 MO STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS FOR HIGHWAY CONSTRUCTION

COUNTIES	VENDORS										
	Higgins Asphalt	N.B. West	APAC	Lake Asphalt	Hilty Quarries	Asphalt Products	Pace Const.	Christensen Brothers	Rolla Asphalt	Willard Asphalt	Lafarge
BENTON											
BOONE			\$51.00								
CAMDEN			\$51.00	\$52.00							
CALLAWAY			\$54.00					\$51.00			
COLE						\$47.00					
COOPER											
CRAWFORD		\$45.00							\$50.00		
FRANKLIN											
GASCONADE											
LACLEDE										\$52.00	
MARIES											
MILLER			\$51.00	\$52.00							
MONITEAU											
MONTGOMERY							\$50.00				
MORGAN											
OSAGE	\$51.10										
PETTIS											\$51.00
PHELPS									\$50.00		
PULASKI										\$52.00	
SALINE			\$56.00								
JOHNSON					\$59.00						
HENRY					\$59.00						

*** MoDOT RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CHOOSE A SUPPLIER BASED UPON AVAILABILITY AND COST IN RESPECT TO PLANT LOCATIONS IN ANY GIVEN AREA PER PROJECT.



MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
DISTRICT 5
D5-09-035B BID TABULATION - ASPHALT PLANT PICKUP / PRICE PER TON
 PRICES ARE GOOD FROM APRIL 15, 2009 THROUGH MAY 31, 2009.

ITEM #4 - PLANT MIX BITUMINOUS SURFACE LEVELING FOLLOWING SPECIFICATION SECTION 402 MO STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS FOR HIGHWAY CONSTRUCTION

COUNTIES	VENDORS										
	Higgins Asphalt	N.B. West	APAC	Lake Asphalt	Hilty Quarries	Asphalt Products	Pace Const.	Christensen Brothers	Rolla Asphalt	Willard Asphalt	Lafarge
BENTON											
BOONE			\$51.00								
CAMDEN			\$51.00	\$52.00							
CALLAWAY			\$54.00					\$51.00			
COLE						\$47.00					
COOPER											
CRAWFORD		\$45.00							\$50.00		
FRANKLIN											
GASCONADE											
LACLEDE										\$52.00	
MARIES											
MILLER			\$51.00	\$52.00							
MONITEAU											
MONTGOMERY							\$50.00				
MORGAN											
OSAGE	\$51.10										
PETTIS											\$51.00
PHELPS									\$50.00		
PULASKI										\$52.00	
SALINE			\$56.00								
JOHNSON					\$59.00						
HENRY					\$59.00						

*** MoDOT RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CHOOSE A SUPPLIER BASED UPON AVAILABILITY AND COST IN RESPECT TO PLANT LOCATIONS IN ANY GIVEN AREA PER PROJECT.



MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
DISTRICT 5
D5-09-035B BID TABULATION - ASPHALT PLANT PICKUP / PRICE PER TON
 PRICES ARE GOOD FROM APRIL 15, 2009 THROUGH MAY 31, 2009.

ITEM #5 - COLD MIX FOLLOWING SPEC MGS-93-07A, SECTION 1004 GRADE 1 MODIFICATION OF 1/2" PASSING 100% GRADATION

VENDORS															
COUNTIES	Higgins Asphalt	N.B. West	APAC	Lake Asphalt	Hilty Quarries	Asphalt Products	Pace Const.	Christensen Brothers	Rolla Asphalt	Willard Asphalt	Lafarge				
BENTON				NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID								
BOONE			\$95.00												
CAMDEN															
CALLAWAY												\$120.00			
COLE															
COOPER															
CRAWFORD		\$55.00											\$58.00		
FRANKLIN															
GASCONADE															
LACLEDE														\$58.00	
MARIES															
MILLER															
MONITEAU															
MONTGOMERY															
MORGAN															
OSAGE	\$59.98														
PETTIS															\$53.60
PHELPS													\$58.00		
PULASKI														\$58.00	
SALINE															
JOHNSON					\$56.00										
HENRY					\$56.00										

*** MoDOT RESERVES THE RIGHT TO CHOOSE A SUPPLIER BASED UPON AVAILABILITY AND COST IN RESPECT TO PLANT LOCATIONS IN ANY GIVEN AREA PER PROJECT.