MaDOT

Missouri Department of Transportation - District 5
Bid Tabulation of Request D5-08-048Q Walk Behind Mowers

Prices good through September 30, 2008

Item 1: Region 1 (Sedalia)

VENDORS

Heartland Farm &

Farm Power Lawn &

Sydenstricker

Popp's Outdoor

Approx. 10 days

Lawn Leisure Equipment Schafter Equipment
17 HP w/ 48" Deck
Unit Price $4,636.92 $4,899.00 $4,640.00
NO BID NO BID
Brand/Model John Deere 7H17 John Deere 7H17 John Deere 7H17
Delivery| 2 wks 45 days or less
19 HP w/ 48" Deck
Unit Price $4,955.00
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brand/Model Toro 30288
Delivery| Approx. 10 days
19 HP w/ 54" Deck 52" inch deck
Unit Price $5,151.04 $5,380.00 $5,110.00 $5,335.00
NO BID
Brand/Model John Deere 7H19 John Deere 7H19 Toro 30289 John Deere 7H19
Delivery| 2 wks 45 days or less

Bold Denotes Low Bidder - This is not an order

Prepared by Corey Duemmel

General Services
(573) 526-6956




MoDOT

Missouri Department of Transportation - District 5
Bid Tabulation of Request D5-08-048Q Walk Behind Mowers

Prices good through September 30, 2008

Item 2: Region 2 (Boonville, Columbia)

VENDORS

Heartland Farm &

Farm Power Lawn &

Sydenstricker

Poop's Outdoor

Schaffter Equipment

Lawn Leisure Equipment
17 HP w/ 48" Deck
Unit Price $4,919.33 $4,875.00 $4,880.00 $4,640.00
NO BID
Brand/Model John Deere 7H17 John Deere 7H17 John Deere 7TH17 John Deere 7H17
Delivery| 2 wks 45 days or less 30 days
19 HP w/ 48" Deck
Unit Price $4,955.00
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brand/Model Toro 30288
Delivery| Approx. 10 days
19 HP w/ 54" Deck 52" inch deck
Unit Price $5,447.88 $5,360.00 $5,394.00 $5,110.00 $5,335.00
Brand/Model John Deere 7H19 John Deere 7H19 John Deere 7H19 Toro 30289 John Deere 7H19
Delivery| 2 wks 45 days or less 30 days Approx. 10 days

Bold Denotes Low Bidder - This is not an order

Prepared by Corey Duemmel

General Services
(573) 526-6956




MoDOT

Missouri Department of Transportation - District 5
Bid Tabulation of Request D5-08-048Q Walk Behind Mowers

Prices good through September 30, 2008

Item 3: Region 3 (Jefferson City, Fulton, Meta, Linn)

VENDORS

Heartland Farm &

Farm Power Lawn &

Sydenstricker

Popp's Out door

Approx. 10 days

Lawn Leisure Equipment Schafter Equipment
17 HP w/ 48" Deck
Unit Price $4,875.00 $4,880.00 $4,645.00
NO BID NO BID
Brand/Model John Deere 7TH17 John Deere 7H17 John Deere 7H17
Delivery| 45 days or less 30 days
19 HP w/ 48" Deck
Unit Price $4,955.00
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brand/Model Toro 30288
Delivery| Approx. 10 days
19 HP w/ 54" Deck 52" inch deck
Unit Price $5,360.00 $5,394.00 $5,110.00 $5,340.00
NO BID
Brand/Model John Deere 7H19 John Deere 7H19 Toro 30289 John Deere 7H19
Delivery| 45 days or less 30 days

Bold Denotes Low Bidder - This is not an order

Prepared by Corey Duemmel

General Services
(573) 526-6956



MaDOT

Missouri Department of Transportation - District 5
Bid Tabulation of Request D5-08-048Q Walk Behind Mowers

Prices good through September 30, 2008

Iltem 4: Region 4 (Versailles, Osage Beach, Iberia)

VENDORS

Heartland Farm &

Farm Power Lawn &

Sydenstricker

Popp's Outdoor

Approx. 10 days

Lawn Leisure Equipment Schafter Equipment
17 HP w/ 48" Deck
Unit Price $4,895.00 $4,630.00
NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brand/Model John Deere 7H17 John Deere 7H17
Delivery| 45 days or less
19 HP w/ 48" Deck
Unit Price $4,955.00
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brand/Model Toro 30288
Delivery| Approx. 10 days
19 HP w/ 54" Deck 52" inch deck
Unit Price $5,385.00 $5,110.00 $5,325.00
NO BID NO BID
Brand/Model John Deere 7H19 Toro 30289 John Deere 7H19
Delivery| 45 days or less

Bold Denotes Low Bidder - This is not an order

Prepared by Corey Duemmel

General Services
(573) 526-6956




