TABULATION OF QUOTE

QUOTE NUMBER

| D1-07-103

ST. JOSEPH, MISSOURI

MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
DISTRICT 1 OFFICE

Thank you for your response to our Request for Informal Quotation # D1-07-103. For
your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses, which were received.

This quotation was awarded as Item By Item to: Logan Contractors Supply.

Lead
Time
Bidder Qty Description Weekly Monthly | Needed
Logan 185 CFM Portable Air Compressor,
Contractors with 50° — % hose
Supply (This unit will begin rent
approximately May, 07 for the
1 | summer months) $165.00 $495.00 | One Day
Steel Drum Vibratory Roller
(10— 12 ton)
(This unit will begin rent One
1 | approximately June, 07) $1,050.00 | $3,150.00 Week
Vibratory Sheeps Foot Roller
(10— 12 ton)
(May need anytime) One
1 $1,050.00 | $3,150.00 Week
The Victor L. 185 CFM Portable Air Compressor,
Phillips with 50° — %4 hose
Company (This unit will begin rent
approximately May, 07 for the
1 | summer months) $250.00 $595.00 ASAP
Steel Drum Vibratory Roller
(10— 12 ton)
(This unit will begin rent
1 | approximately June, 07) $1,295.00 | $3,500.00 ASAP
Vibratory Sheeps Foot Roller
(10— 12 ton)
1 | (May need anytime) $1,495.00 | $3,995.00 | ASAP




Bidder

Qty

Description

Weekly

Monthly

Lead
Time
Needed

Hertz
Equipment
Rental
Corporation

185 CFM Portable Air Compressor,
with 50° — % hose

(This unit will begin rent
approximately May, 07 for the
summer months)

$379.00

$770.00

1-2
Weeks

Steel Drum Vibratory Roller
(10— 12 ton)

(This unit will begin rent
approximately June, 07)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Vibratory Sheeps Foot Roller
(10— 12 ton)

(May need anytime)

$1,650.00

$4,120.00

1-2
Weeks

Murphy Tractor
& Equipment

185 CFM Portable Air Compressor,
with 50° — % hose

(This unit will begin rent
approximately May, 07 for the
summer months)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Steel Drum Vibratory Roller
(10— 12 ton)

(This unit will begin rent
approximately June, 07)

$1,225.00

$3,500

24
Hours

Vibratory Sheeps Foot Roller
(10— 12 ton)

(May need anytime)

$1,575.00

$4,500

24
Hours

Halco, Inc.

185 CFM Portable Air Compressor,
with 50° — % hose

(This unit will begin rent
approximately May, 07 for the
summer months)

$300.00

$645.00

5 DAYS

Steel Drum Vibratory Roller
(10— 12 ton)

(This unit will begin rent
approximately June, 07)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Vibratory Sheeps Foot Roller
(10— 12 ton)

(May need anytime)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown
below. Buyer: Darrel Butcher, Procurement Supervisor.

Contact: Darrel Butcher
Procurement Supervisor

Address:
3602 N. Belt Highway

MoDOT

St. Joseph, Missouri, 64506-1399

Phone: 816-387-2469
816-387-2368

Fax:




