
Missouri  

Department  

of Transportation  
Kirk Juranus, District Engineer 

     BID 
 

     TABULATION 
      
     District 8 - Purchasing 
     

Springfield Area District
3025 East Kearney Street

M.O. Box 868
Springfield, MO  65801

(417) 895-7600
Fax (417) 895-7610

www.modot.org
Toll free 1-888 ASK MoDOT

 
Thank you for your response to our Request for Bid # “D8PP-10011”.  For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses which were received.  This bid was awarded to:   SEE 
BELOW       If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown below. Buyer; Andy McNeill, Intermediate Procurement Agent. 
 

 GROUP A Total Group A GROUP B Total Group B 

 Estimated Quantity: 
40 

Estimated Quantity: 
40 

 Estimated Quantity: 
40 

 

 
 

Vendor: 

Eagle Spill Containment 
Pallets 

Model 1645 

Eagle Brand Spill Containment 
Poly Ramp 

Model:  1689 

 Drum Truck  

Workizer Work Products $269.00 $138.65 $16,306.00 No Bid  
MSC Industrial Supply 210.00 108.00 $12,720.00 No Bid  

Grainger 169.30 105.10 $10,979.20 75.36 3014.40 
Global Industrial 214.55 118.38 13,317.20 175.99 7039.60 

Wise El Santo 154.98 103.38 10,334.40 116.88 4675.20 
RL Hoener 279.38 154.85 17,369.20 No Bid  

McGregor Hardware 266.00 136.00 16,080.00 No Bid  
Airgas MidSouth 222.92 124.03 $13,878.00 139.60 5584.00 
C&H Distributors 165.36 117.87 11,329.20 128.05 5122.00 

E&R Industrial Sales 167.44 126.87 11772.40 131.08 5243.20 
New Pig Corporation 290.15 211.80 20,078.00 No Bid  

Consultant Engineering, Inc 252.00 135.00 15,480.00 127.00 5080.00 
ADDITIONAL NOTES:  Group A awarded to:  Wise El Santo and Group B awarded to:  Grainger 
Andy McNeill, CPPB 
Intermediate Procurement Agent 
Phone: 417-895-7645 


