
MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 
WILLOW SPRINGS, MISSOURI 

Tabulation of Bids Received May 8, 2009 
Quotation Number D9091985R9 

 
 

 
Description      Vendor    Total Cost    Remarks 
 
Mastech MAS830l     Anixter, Inc.     18.69     Award Bid 
Paladin 4933 Ult. Premise Service Kit        345.55     Award Bid 
Master Appliance 10724 Con. Kit       No Bid      
5/16” Blk. Dacron UV Res. Rope       No Bid      
3/16” Blk. Dacron UV Res. Rope       No Bid      
TRIcrimp Tool for 15, 30, 45 amp       460.00     Reject Bid 
30 amp 12 Ga. Red/Blk Anderson Powerpole Sets PP30-100    45.00/50, 90.00/100   Reject Bid 
Assorted Black Cable Ties Cardner Bender #71111     No Bid      
14/3 – 100’ Outdoor Extension Cord       No Bid      
14/3 – 50’ Outdoor Extension Cord       No Bid      
Panavise PV Jr. PVP201          21.00     Award Bid 
Guardian KMW62630 Basic Surge Strip       No Bid 
3M Heat  shrink tubing kit, black, assorted sizes 102 pcs     No Bid 
Weller P2C Portasol Prof. Self Igniting cordless butane solder iron   No Bid 
16’ Fiberglass Ladder Rated Type 1A – D6216-2     187.05     Award Bid 
400W Westward Power Inverter        No Bid       
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 

MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 
WILLOW SPRINGS, MISSOURI 

Tabulation of Bids Received May 8, 2009 
Quotation Number D9091985R9 

 
 
 
Description      Vendor    Total Cost    Remarks 
 
Mastech MAS830l     Stockton Construction      48.43        
Paladin 4933 Ultimate Premise Service Kit       1087.00      
Master Appliance 10724 Con. Kit         226.00     Reject Bid  
5/16” Blk. Dacron UV Res. Rope         287.24     Reject Bid 
3/16” Blk. Dacron UV Res. Rope         189.00     Reject Bid 
TRIcrimp Tool for 15, 30, 45 amp           88.51     Reject Bid 
30 amp 12 Ga. Red/Blk Anderson Powerpole Sets PP30-100      155.31     Reject Bid 
Assorted Black Cable Ties Gardner Bender #71111         23.38     Reject Bid  
14/3 – 100’ Outdoor Extension Cord           80.16     Reject Bid  
14/3 – 50’ Outdoor Extension Cord           48.43     Reject Bid  
Panavise PV Jr. PVP201            52.00       
Guardian KMW62630 Basic Surge Strip           53.44     Reject Bid 
3M Heat shrink tubing kit, black, assorted sizes 102 pcs         20.04     Reject Bid 
Weller P2C Portasol Prof. Self Igniting cordless butane solder iron                                         83.50     Reject Bid 
16’ Fiberglass Ladder Rated Type 1A – D6216-2       466.00      
400W Westward Power Inverter          130.26     Reject Bid 
 
 
Graybar Non Responsive 
Tessco  Non Responsive 
Cxtec  Non Responsive 
Orbital Data Non Responsive 


