MODOT Central District

M |SSOU I‘I 1511 Missouri Boulevard
P.O. Box 718
Department 4 ( Jefferson City, MO 65102

(573) 751-3322
fax (573) 522-1059
Toll free 1-888 ASK MoDOT

Roger Schwartze, District Engineer www.modot.org

of Transportation

October 3, 2008

Re: Bid Tabulation for Bid D5-09-009B, Trash Service
Dear Vendors:

Following is the bid tabulation from bid D5-09-009B and it is not a “Notice to Proceed.” An
individual maintenance shed will be in charge of reviewing their current needs and current trash
service pricing versus the new submitted pricing. Each shed will take the established pricing into
consideration on their future decision. In addition, there are a few sheds that currently use the
services of the city they reside in. All will be reviewed and taken into consideration.

The attached bid tabulation is listed by size of container and the number of times of pick up per
week. Sheds that had more than one vendor supply pricing, that particular low pricing is
indicated in bold.

When a maintenance shed makes a decision, I will be working with them to issue letters to
proceed with service and/or letters to withdraw existing canisters. If you currently are providing
service to our MoDOT District 5 maintenance facilities, please continue to do so until notified of
the decision that is made.

Thank you for interest in bidding.

Sincerely,
Corey Duemumel

Corey Duemmel
Sr. Procurement Agent
(573) 526-6956

Our mission is to provide a world-class transportation experience that delights our customers and promotes a prosperous Missouri.
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MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets

Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets

Bid Request # D5-09-009B
Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL

1 cu. Yard Container

1 cu. Yard Container

Pick Up 1x/week

Pick Up 2x/week

. Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Award Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Award
Location
Average Average
Boonville
Veolia ES $42.00 $44.00 $46.00 $44.00 $55.00 $57.00 $59.00 $57.00
Norris & Sons $40.00 $45.00 $50.00 $45.00 $60.00 $65.00 $70.00 $65.00
Cooper Cty Trash $40.00 $42.50 $45.00 $42.50 $58.00 $62.00 $68.00 $62.67
Boonville RA
Veolia ES $42.00 $44.00 $46.00 $44.00 $55.00 $57.00 $59.00 $57.00
Blackwater
Norris & Sons $40.00 $45.00 $50.00 $45.00 $60.00 $65.00 $70.00 $65.00
Cooper Cty Trash $40.00 $42.50 $45.00 $42.50 $58.00 $62.00 $68.00 $62.67
Jamestown
Veolia ES $42.00 $44.00 $46.00 $44.00 $55.00 $57.00 $59.00 $57.00
Hughesville
Norris & Sons $40.00 $45.00 $50.00 $45.00 $60.00 $65.00 $70.00 $65.00
Sedalia
Norris & Sons $40.00 $45.00 $50.00 $45.00 $60.00 $65.00 $70.00 $65.00
Warsaw
Norris & Sons $40.00 $45.00 $50.00 $45.00 $60.00 $65.00 $70.00 $65.00
Cole Camp
Norris & Sons $40.00 $45.00 $50.00 $45.00 $60.00 $65.00 $70.00
Lincoln
Norris & Sons $40.00 $45.00 $50.00 $45.00 $60.00 $65.00 $70.00
Columbia
Veolia ES $42.00 $44.00 $46.00 $44.00 $55.00 $57.00 $59.00 $57.00
AAA Waste| $38.00 $39.14 $40.31 $39.15 $55.00 $56.65 $58.35 $56.67
Hallsville
Veolia ES $42.00 $44.00 $46.00 $44.00 $55.00 $57.00 $59.00 $57.00
AAA Waste| $38.00 $39.14 $40.31 $39.15 $55.00 $56.65 $58.35 $56.67
Harrisburg
Veolia ES $42.00 $44.00 $46.00 $44.00 $55.00 $57.00 $59.00 $57.00
AAA Waste| $38.00 $39.14 $40.31 $39.15 $55.00 $56.65 $58.35 $56.67




MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets Bid Request # D5-09-009B
P11 Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL

Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets

Rocheport
Veolia ES $42.00 $44.00 $46.00 $44.00 $55.00 $57.00 $59.00 $57.00
AAA Waste| $38.00 $39.14 $40.31 $39.15 $55.00 $56.65 $58.35 $56.67
Cooper Cty Trash $40.00 $42.50 $45.00 $42.50 $58.00 $62.00 $68.00 $62.67
Ashland
AAA Waste $38.00 $39.14 $40.31 $39.15 $55.00 $56.65 $58.35 $56.67
Fulton
EbersoleTrash $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00
AAA Waste| $38.00 $39.14 $40.31 $39.15 $55.00 $56.65 $58.35 $56.67
Auxvasse
Mokane
EbersoleTrash $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00
New Bloomfield
EbersoleTrash $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00
Camdenton
Allied Waste $30.66 $32.19 $33.80 $32.22 $46.01 $48.31 $50.73 $48.35
Montreal
Allied Waste $30.66 $32.19 $33.80 $32.22 $46.01 $48.31 $50.73 $48.35
Waste Corp. Lebanon $28.00 $28.00 $28.00 $28.00 $56.00 $56.00 $56.00 $56.00
Osage Beach
Allied Waste $30.66 $32.19 $33.80 $32.22 $46.01 $48.31 $50.73 $48.35
Handi-Jon $46.06 $49.20 $52.50 $49.25 $61.71 $66.02 $70.65 $66.13
Waste Corp. Lebanon $28.00 $28.00 $28.00 $28.00 $56.00 $56.00 $56.00 $56.00
Iberia
Allied Waste $30.66 $32.19 $33.80 $32.22 $46.01 $48.31 $50.73 $48.35
Waste Corp - Rolla $31.00 $31.00 $31.00 $31.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00
Eldon
Handi-Jon $46.06 $49.20 $52.50 $49.25 $61.71 $66.02 $70.65 $66.13
California
Stover
Versailles
Tipton
Norris & Sons $40.00 $45.00 $50.00 $45.00 $60.00 $65.00 $70.00 $65.00
Cooper Cty Trash $40.00 $42.50 $45.00 $42.50 $58.00 $62.00 $68.00 $62.67
Jefferson City
Brazito




MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets Bid Request # D5-09-009B
P11 Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL

Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets

Vienna
Waste Corp - Rolla $31.00 $31.00 $31.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00
Meta
Owensville
Swinger San. $41.00 $41.00 $41.00 $41.00 $52.00 $52.00 $52.00 $52.00
Waste Corp - Rolla $31.00 $31.00 $31.00 $31.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00
Belle
Swinger San. $41.00 $41.00 $41.00 $41.00 $52.00 $52.00 $52.00 $52.00
Waste Corp - Rolla $31.00 $31.00 $31.00 $31.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00
Linn
Drake
Swinger San. $41.00 $41.00 $41.00 $41.00 No Bid
Chamois

Landscaping

Concrete Crew

Bridge Crew

Signal/Striping

Mechanic Garage

Camdenton PO

Jefferson City PO

District 5 Office




<o CO> T

MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets

Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets

Bid Request # D5-09-009B
Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL

2 cu. Yard Container

2 cu. Yard Container

Pick Up 1x/week

Pick Up 2x/week

. Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Award Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Award
Location
Average Average
Boonville
Veolia ES $52.00 $54.00 $56.00 $54.00 $70.00 $72.00 $74.00 $72.00
Norris & Sons $45.00 $50.00 $55.00 $50.00 $55.00 $60.00 $65.00 $60.00
Boonville RA
Veolia ES $52.00 $54.00 $56.00 $54.00 $70.00 $72.00 $74.00 $72.00
Blackwater
Norris & Sons $45.00 $50.00 $55.00 $50.00 $55.00 $60.00 $65.00 $60.00
Cooper Cty Trash $55.00 $57.50 $60.00 $57.50 $78.00 $82.50 $90.00 $83.50
Jamestown
Veolia ES $52.00 $54.00 $56.00 $54.00 $70.00 $72.00 $74.00 $72.00
Hughesville
Norris & Sons $45.00 $50.00 $55.00 $50.00 $55.00 $60.00 $65.00 $60.00
Sedalia
Norris & Sons $45.00 $50.00 $55.00 $50.00
Warsaw
Norris & Sons $45.00 $50.00 $55.00 $50.00 $55.00 $60.00 $65.00 $60.00
Cole Camp
Norris & Sons $45.00 $50.00 $55.00 $50.00 $55.00 $60.00 $65.00 $60.00
Lincoln
Norris & Sons $45.00 $50.00 $55.00 $50.00 $55.00 $60.00 $65.00 $60.00
Columbia
Veolia ES $52.00 $54.00 $56.00 $54.00 $70.00 $72.00 $74.00 $72.00
AAA Waste| $47.00 $48.41 $49.86 $48.42 $64.00 $65.92 $67.90 $65.94
Hallsville
Veolia ES $52.00 $54.00 $56.00 $54.00 $70.00 $72.00 $74.00 $72.00
AAA Waste| $47.00 $48.41 $49.86 $48.42 $64.00 $65.92 $67.90 $65.94
Harrisburg
Veolia ES $52.00 $54.00 $56.00 $54.00 $70.00 $72.00 $74.00 $72.00
AAA Waste| $47.00 $48.41 $49.86 $48.42 $64.00 $65.92 $67.90 $65.94




MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets Bid Request # D5-09-009B
P11 Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL

Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets

Rocheport
Veolia ES $52.00 $54.00 $56.00 $54.00 $70.00 $72.00 $74.00 $72.00
AAA Waste $47.00 $48.41 $49.86 $48.42 $64.00 $65.92 $67.90 $65.94
Cooper Cty Trash $55.00 $57.50 $60.00 $57.50 $78.00 $82.50 $90.00 $83.50
Ashland
AAA Waste $47.00 $48.41 $49.86 $48.42 $64.00 $65.92 $67.90 $65.94
Fulton
EbersoleTrash $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00
AAA Waste $47.00 $48.41 $49.86 $48.42 $64.00 $65.92 $67.90 $65.94
Auxvasse
Mokane
EbersoleTrash $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00
New Bloomfield
EbersoleTrash $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00
Camdenton
Allied Waste $42.05 $44.15 $46.36 $44.19 $65.93 $69.23 $72.69 $69.28
Montreal
Allied Waste $42.05 $44.15 $46.36 $44.19 $65.93 $69.23 $72.69 $69.28
Waste Corp. Lebanon $36.00 $36.00 $36.00 $36.00 $72.00 $72.00 $72.00 $72.00
Osage Beach
Waste Corp. Lebanon $42.05 $44.15 $46.36 $44.19 $65.93 $69.23 $72.69 $69.28
Handi-Jon $61.71 $66.02 $70.65 $66.13 $114.17 $122.16 $130.71 $122.35
Waste Corp. Lebanon $36.00 $36.00 $36.00 $36.00 $72.00 $72.00 $72.00 $72.00
Iberia
Allied Waste $42.05 $44.15 $46.36 $44.19 $65.93 $69.23 $72.69 $69.28
Waste Corp - Rolla $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00
Eldon
Handi-Jon $61.71 $66.02 $70.65 $66.13 $114.17 $122.16 $130.71 $122.35
California
Stover
Versailles
Tipton
Norris & Sons $45.00 $50.00 $55.00 $50.00 $55.00 $60.00 $65.00 $60.00
Cooper Cty Trash $55.00 $57.50 $60.00 $57.50 $78.00 $82.50 $90.00 $83.50
Jefferson City
Brazito




MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets Bid Request # D5-09-009B
P11 Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL

Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets

Vienna
Waste Corp - Rolla $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00
Meta
Owensville
Swinger San. $54.00 $54.00 $54.00 $54.00 $65.00 $65.00 $65.00 $65.00
Waste Corp - Rolla $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00
Belle
Swinger San. $54.00 $54.00 $54.00 $54.00 $65.00 $65.00 $65.00 $65.00
Waste Corp - Rolla $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00
Linn
Drake
Swinger San. $54.00 $54.00 $54.00 $54.00 No Bid $0.00
Chamois

Landscaping

Concrete Crew

Bridge Crew

Signal/Striping

Mechanic Garage

Camdenton PO

Jefferson City PO

District 5 Office
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MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets

Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets

Bid Request # D5-09-009B
Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL

4 cu. Yard Container

4 cu. Yard Container

Pick Up 1x/week

Pick Up 2x/week

. Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Award Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Award
Location
Average Average
Boonville
Veolia ES $70.00 $72.00 $74.00 $72.00 $110.00 $114.00 $116.00 $113.33
Norris & Sons $65.00 $70.00 $75.00 $70.00 $75.00 $85.00 $95.00 $85.00
Cooper Cty Trash $78.00 $80.00 $82.50 $80.17 $105.00 $115.00 $122.50 $114.17
Boonville RA
Veolia ES $70.00 $72.00 $74.00 $72.00 $110.00 $114.00 $116.00 $113.33
Blackwater
Norris & Sons $65.00 $70.00 $75.00 $70.00 $75.00 $85.00 $95.00 $85.00
Cooper Cty Trash $78.00 $80.00 $82.50 $80.17 $105.00 $115.00 $122.50 $114.17
Jamestown
Veolia ES $70.00 $72.00 $74.00 $72.00 $110.00 $114.00 $116.00 $113.33
Hughesville
Norris & Sons $65.00 $70.00 $75.00 $70.00 $75.00 $85.00 $95.00 $85.00
Sedalia
Norris & Sons $65.00 $70.00 $75.00 $70.00 $75.00 $85.00 $95.00 $85.00
Warsaw
Norris & Sons $65.00 $70.00 $75.00 $70.00 $75.00 $85.00 $95.00 $85.00
Cole Camp
Norris & Sons $65.00 $70.00 $75.00 $70.00 $75.00 $85.00 $95.00 $85.00
Lincoln
Norris & Sons $65.00 $70.00 $75.00 $70.00 $75.00 $85.00 $95.00 $85.00
Columbia
Veolia ES $70.00 $72.00 $74.00 $72.00 $110.00 $114.00 $116.00 $113.33
AAA Waste| $65.00 $66.95 $68.95 $66.97 $80.00 $82.40 $84.87 $82.42
Hallsville
Veolia ES $70.00 $72.00 $74.00 $72.00 $110.00 $114.00 $116.00 $113.33
AAA Waste| $65.00 $66.95 $68.95 $66.97 $80.00 $82.40 $84.87 $82.42
Dayne's $57.75 $57.75 $57.75 $57.75 No Bid
Harrisburg
Veolia ES $70.00 $72.00 $74.00 $72.00 $110.00 $114.00 $116.00 $113.33
AAA Waste| $65.00 $66.95 $68.95 $66.97 $80.00 $82.40 $84.87 $82.42




MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets Bid Request # D5-09-009B
P11 Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL

Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets

Rocheport
Veolia ES $70.00 $72.00 $74.00 $72.00 $110.00 $114.00 $116.00 $113.33
AAA Waste| $65.00 $66.95 $68.95 $66.97 $80.00 $82.40 $84.87 $82.42
Cooper Cty Trash $78.00 $80.00 $82.50 $80.17 $105.00 $115.00 $122.50 $114.17
Ashland
AAA Waste $65.00 $66.95 $68.95 $66.97 $80.00 $82.40 $84.87 $82.42
Fulton
EbersoleTrash $70.00 $70.00 $70.00 $70.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00
AAA Waste $65.00 $66.95 $68.95 $66.97 $80.00 $82.40 $84.87 $82.42
Auxvasse
Mokane
EbersoleTrash $70.00 $70.00 $70.00 $70.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00
New Bloomfield
EbersoleTrash $70.00 $70.00 $70.00 $70.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00
Camdenton
Allied Waste $67.01 $70.36 $73.88 $70.42 $119.66 $125.64 $131.92 $125.74
Montreal
Allied Waste $67.01 $70.36 $73.88 $70.42 $119.66 $125.64 $131.92 $125.74
Waste Corp. Lebanon $63.00 $63.00 $63.00 $63.00 $113.00 $113.00 $113.00 $113.00
Osage Beach
Allied Waste $67.01 $70.36 $73.88 $70.42 $119.66 $125.64 $131.92 $125.74
Handi-Jon $88.56 $94.75 $101.39 $94.90 $183.83 $185.29 $187.56 $185.56
Waste Corp. Lebanon $63.00 $63.00 $63.00 $63.00 $113.00 $113.00 $113.00 $113.00
Iberia
Allied Waste $67.01 $70.36 $73.88 $70.42 $119.66 $125.64 $131.92 $125.74
Waste Corp - Rolla $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $78.00 $78.00 $78.00 $78.00
Eldon
Handi-Jon $88.56 $94.75 $101.39 $94.90 $183.83 $185.29 $187.56 $185.56
California
Cooper Cty Trash $78.50 $80.00 $82.50 $80.33 $105.00 $115.00 $122.50 $114.17
Stover
Versailles
Tipton
Norris & Sons $65.00 $70.00 $75.00 $70.00 $75.00 $85.00 $95.00 $85.00
Cooper Cty Trash $78.00 $80.00 $82.50 $80.17 $105.00 $115.00 $122.50 $114.17




MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets Bid Request # D5-09-009B
P11 Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL

Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets

Jefferson City

Brazito
Vienna
Waste Corp - Rolla $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $78.00 $78.00 $78.00 $78.00
Meta
Owensville
Swinger San. $66.00 $66.00 $66.00 $66.00 $78.00 $78.00 $78.00 $78.00
Waste Corp - Rolla $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $78.00 $78.00 $78.00 $78.00
Belle
Swinger San. $66.00 $66.00 $66.00 $66.00 $78.00 $78.00 $78.00 $78.00
Waste Corp - Rolla $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $78.00 $78.00 $78.00 $78.00
Linn
Drake
Swinger San. $66.00 $66.00 $66.00 $66.00 No Bid
Chamois

Landscaping

Concrete Crew

Bridge Crew

Signal/Striping

Mechanic Garage

Camdenton PO

Jefferson City PO

District 5 Office




<o CO> T

MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets

Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets

Bid Request # D5-09-009B
Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL

6 cu. Yard Container

6 cu. Yard Container

Pick Up 1x/week

Pick Up 2x/week

. Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Award Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Award
Location
Average Average
Boonville
Veolia ES $110.00 $113.00 $116.00 $113.00 $155.00 $160.00 $165.00 $160.00
Norris & Sons $87.00 $92.00 $97.00 $92.00 NA
Cooper Cty Trash $115.00 $120.00 $125.00 $120.00 $180.00 $190.00 $200.00 $190.00
Boonville RA
Veolia ES $110.00 $113.00 $116.00 $113.00 $155.00 $160.00 $165.00 $160.00
Cooper Cty Trash $115.00 $120.00 $125.00 $120.00 $180.00 $190.00 $200.00 $190.00
Blackwater
Norris & Sons $87.00 $92.00 $97.00 $92.00
Cooper Cty Trash $115.00 $120.00 $125.00 $120.00 $180.00 $190.00 $200.00 $190.00
Jamestown
Veolia ES $110.00 $113.00 $116.00 $113.00 $155.00 $160.00 $165.00 $160.00
Hughesville
Norris & Sons $87.00 $92.00 $97.00 $92.00 NA
Sedalia | |
Norris & Sons $87.00 $92.00 $97.00 $92.00 NA
Warsaw | |
Norris & Sons $87.00 $92.00 $97.00 $92.00 NA
Cole Camp | |
Norris & Sons $87.00 $92.00 $97.00 $92.00 NA
Lincoln | |
Norris & Sons $87.00 $92.00 $97.00 $92.00 NA
Columbia
Veolia ES $110.00 $113.00 $116.00 $113.00 $155.00 $160.00 $165.00 $160.00
AAA Waste| $88.00 $90.64 $93.36 $90.67 $104.00 $107.12 $110.33 $107.15
Hallsville
Veolia ES $110.00 $113.00 $116.00 $113.00 $155.00 $160.00 $165.00 $160.00
AAA Waste| $88.00 $90.64 $93.36 $90.67 $104.00 $107.12 $110.33 $107.15
Harrisburg
Veolia ES $110.00 $113.00 $116.00 $113.00 $155.00 $160.00 $165.00 $160.00
AAA Waste| $88.00 $90.64 $93.36 $90.67 $104.00 $107.12 $110.33 $107.15




MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets Bid Request # D5-09-009B
P11 Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL

Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets

Rocheport
Veolia ES $110.00 $113.00 $116.00 $113.00 $155.00 $160.00 $165.00 $160.00
AAA Waste $88.00 $90.64 $93.36 $90.67 $104.00 $107.12 $110.33 $107.15
Cooper Cty Trash $115.00 $120.00 $125.00 $120.00 $180.00 $190.00 $200.00 $190.00
Ashland
AAA Waste $88.00 $90.64 $93.36 $90.67 $104.00 $107.12 $110.33 $107.15
Fulton
EbersoleTrash $85.00 $85.00 $85.00 $85.00 $95.00 $95.00 $95.00 $95.00
AAA Waste $88.00 $90.64 $93.36 $90.67 $104.00 $107.12 $110.33 $107.15
Auxvasse
Dayne's $97.76 $97.76 $97.76 $97.76 No Bid
Mokane
EbersoleTrash $85.00 $85.00 $85.00 $85.00 $95.00 $95.00 $95.00 $95.00
New Bloomfield
EbersoleTrash $85.00 $8.00 $85.00 $59.33 $95.00 $95.00 $95.00 $95.00
Camdenton
Allied Waste $85.47 $89.74 $94.23 $89.81 $150.58 $158.11 $166.02 $158.24
Montreal
Allied Waste $85.47 $89.74 $94.23 $89.81 $150.58 $158.11 $166.02 $158.24
Waste Corp. Lebanon $77.00 $77.00 $77.00 $77.00
Osage Beach
Allied Waste $85.47 $89.74 $94.23 $89.81 $150.58 $158.11 $166.02 $158.24
Handi-Jon $132.68 $141.96 $146.22 $140.29 $245.46 $262.64 $270.52 $259.54
Waste Corp. Lebanon $77.00 $77.00 $77.00 $77.00
Iberia
Allied Waste $85.47 $89.74 $94.23 $89.81 $150.58 $158.11 $166.02 $158.24
Waste Corp - Rolla $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00
Eldon
Handi-Jon $132.68 $141.96 $146.22 $140.29 $245.46 $262.64 $270.52 $259.54
California
Stover
Versailles
Tipton
Norris & Sons $87.00 $92.00 $97.00 $92.00 $95.00 $100.00 $105.00 $100.00
Cooper Cty Trash $115.00 $120.00 $125.00 $120.00 $180.00 $190.00 $200.00 $190.00
Jefferson City




MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets Bid Request # D5-09-009B
P11 Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL

Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets

Brazito

Vienna

Waste Corp - Rolla $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00

Meta

Owensville

Swinger San. $92.00 $92.00 $92.00 $92.00

Waste Corp - Rolla $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00

Belle

Swinger San. $92.00 $92.00 $92.00 $92.00

Waste Corp - Rolla $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00

Linn

Drake

Swinger San. $92.00 $92.00 $92.00 $92.00 No Bid

Chamois

Landscaping

Concrete Crew

Bridge Crew

Signal/Striping

Mechanic Garage

Camdenton PO

Jefferson City PO

District 5 Office




MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets Bid Request # D5-09-009B
P11 Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL

Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets

8 cu. Yard Container
Pick Up 1x/week
. Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Award
Location
Average
Boonville
Veolia ES No Bid
Norris & Sons $95.00 $100.00 $105.00 $100.00
Cooper Cty Trash $140.00 $147.00 $152.00 $146.33
Boonville RA
Veolia ES No Bid
Cooper Cty Trash $180.00 $190.00 $200.00 $190.00
Blackwater
Norris & Sons $95.00 $100.00 $105.00 $100.00
Cooper Cty Trash $140.00 $147.00 $152.00 $146.33
Jamestown
Veolia ES No Bid
Hughesville
Norris & Sons $95.00 $100.00 $105.00 $100.00
Sedalia
Norris & Sons $95.00 $100.00 $105.00 $100.00
Warsaw
Norris & Sons $95.00 $100.00 $105.00 $100.00
Cole Camp
Norris & Sons $95.00 $100.00 $105.00 $100.00
Lincoln
Norris & Sons $95.00 $100.00 $105.00 $100.00
Columbia
Veolia ES No Bid
AAA Waste $110.00 $113.30 $116.70 $113.33
Hallsville
Veolia ES No Bid
AAA Waste $110.00| $113.30] $116.70 $113.33




MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets Bid Request # D5-09-009B
P11 Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL

Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets

Harrisburg | |
Veolia ES No Bid
AAA Waste $110.00 $113.30 $116.70 $113.33
Rocheport
Veolia ES No Bid
AAA Waste) $110.00 $113.30 $116.70 $113.33
Cooper Cty Trash $140.00 $147.50 $152.50 $146.67
Ashland
AAA Waste $110.00 $113.30 $116.70 $113.33
Fulton
EbersoleTrash No Bid
AAA Waste $110.00 $113.30 $116.70 $113.33
Auxvasse
Mokane
EbersoleTrash No Bid
New Bloomfield | |
EbersoleTrash No Bid
Camdenton
Allied Waste $114.22 $119.93 $125.93 $120.03
Montreal
Allied Waste $114.22 $119.93 $125.93 $120.03
Waste Corp. Lebanon $93.00 $93.00 $93.00 $93.00
Osage Beach
Allied Waste $114.22 $119.93 $125.93 $120.03
Handi-Jon $177.16 $180.15 $183.00 $180.10
Waste Corp. Lebanon $93.00 $93.00 $93.00 $93.00
Iberia
Allied Waste $114.22 $119.93 $125.93 $120.03
Waste Corp - Rolla $147.00 $147.00 $147.00 $147.00
Eldon
Handi-Jon $177.16 $180.15 $183.00 $180.10
California
Stover
Versailles




MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets Bid Request # D5-09-009B
P11 Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL

Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets

Tipton | |

Norris & Sons No Bid

Cooper Cty Trash $140.00 $147.50 $152.50 $146.67

Jefferson City

Brazito

Vienna

Waste Corp - Rolla $147.00 $147.00 $147.00 $147.00

Meta

Owensville

Swinger San. $147.00 $147.00 $147.00 $147.00

Waste Corp - Rolla $147.00 $147.00 $147.00 $147.00

Belle

Swinger San. $147.00 $147.00 $147.00 $147.00

Waste Corp - Rolla $147.00 $147.00 $147.00 $147.00

Linn

Drake

Swinger San. No Bid

Chamois

Landscaping

Concrete Crew

Bridge Crew

Signal/Striping

Mechanic Garage

Camdenton PO

Jefferson City PO

District 5 Office




MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets

Bid Request # D5-09-009B

SO T Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL
Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets
| ONE TIME CALL PRICES |
1 cu. Yard Container 6 cu. Yard Container
Yearl1 | Year2 | Year3 Year1 | Year2 | Year3
Ebersol free 3x' per year Ebersol free 3x' per year
Veolia $45.00 $47.00 $49.00 Veolia $90.00 $94.00 $96.00
Norris & Son $30.00 $35.00 $40.00 Norris & Son $75.00 $80.00 $85.00
Allied Waste $35.00 $36.75 $38.59 Allied Waste $70.00 $73.50 $77.18
Swinger Sanitation $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 Swinger $27.00 $27.00 $27.00
Dayne's No Bid Dayne's No Bid
AAA Waste $18.00 $18.54 $19.10 AAA Waste $36.00 $37.08 $38.19
Handi-Jon $15.00 $16.50 $17.60 Handi-Jon $42.00 $45.00 $48.15
Waste Corp-Rolla $31.00 $31.00 $31.00 Waste Corp-Rolla $80.00 $80.00 $80.00
Waste Corp-Lebanon $25.00 $25.00 $25.00 Waste Corp-Lebanon $45.00 $45.00 $45.00
Cooper County $40.00 $42.50 $45.00 Cooper County| $115.00 $120.00 $125.00
2 cu. Yard Container 8 cu. Yard Container
Yearl1 | Year2 | Year3 Year1 | Year2 | Year3
Ebersol free 3x' per year Ebersol free 3x' per year
Veolia $45.00 $47.00 $49.00 Veolia No Bid
Norris & Son $40.00 $45.00 $50.00 Norris & Son $80.00 $85.00 $90.00
Allied Waste $50.00 $52.50 $55.13 Allied Waste $80.00 $84.00 $88.20
Swinger Sanitation $16.00 $16.00 $16.00 Swinger Sanitation $29.00 $29.00 $29.00
Dayne's No Bid Dayne's No Bid
AAA Waste $22.00 $22.66 $23.34 AAA Waste $40.00 $41.20 $42.44
Handi-Jon $18.50 $19.80 $21.20 Handi-Jon $53.14 $56.80 $60.84
Waste Corp-Rolla $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 Waste Corp-Rolla $123.00 $123.00 $123.00
Waste Corp-Lebanon $25.00 $25.00 $25.00 Waste Corp-Lebanon $57.00 $57.00 $57.00
Cooper County $55.00 $57.50 $60.00 Cooper County $140.00 $147.50 $152.50




MODOT District 5 ~ Trash Service Pricing Sheets Bid Request # D5-09-009B
P11 Due Date: August 28, 2008 1:00 PM CL

Bid Tabulation Pricing Sheets

4 cu. Yard Container
Year1 | Year2 | Year3 *Swinger prices for Belle and Owensville only.

Ebersol free 3x' per year
Veolia $75.00 $78.00 $80.00
Norris & Son $55.00 $60.00 $65.00
Allied Waste $60.00 $63.00 $66.15
Swinger Sanitation $21.00 $21.00 $21.00

Dayne's No Bid

AAA Waste $28.00 $28.84 $29.70
Handi-Jon $26.60 $28.42 $30.41
Waste Corp-Rolla $60.00 $60.00 $60.00
Waste Corp-Lebanon $35.00 $35.00 $35.00
Cooper County $78.00 $80.00 $82.00
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